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During the three years from 1970, we even mobilized the 777 Couples, didn't we? Didn't you do the 
same? This was worldwide. We mobilized them in order to undergo hardships for the sake of the nation 
during the three years. What this means is that there is no family on earth, representing the nation or the 
world, who can be a match for the families of the Unification Church. Every family must become like the 
families in the Unification Church. How we were criticized during those three years! Since their mothers 
and fathers opposed them, the couples wrapped their babies in blankets and left them on the doorsteps of 
their parents' houses at night, before setting out. Why did they have to do that? It was because they had to 
set the condition that they loved their nation more than their own sons and daughters. 
 
In order to do so, some of them even left their children in orphanages. Some husbands split up with their 
wives. After blessing them, instead of letting them live happily ever after, I made them throw away what 
little they had in their households, even pots and pans, and turned them out of their own homes. I did all 
this, so that the Blessed Families of the Unification Church from various tribes could go out to the nation 
as representatives of their tribes and restore them through indemnity. 
 
At first, we were opposed nationwide, but in the end, the circumstances were such that the same people 
were heard to say, "If we want to defend ourselves against Kim Il-sung and save our nation, we must 
become like the members of the Unification Church." We set an example for others, teaching them that if 
you want to save your nation, you must do what we did, and serve the nation by sacrificing your wives 
and children. At the end of the three years, the people who at first had opposed us welcomed us. The fact 
that they did this signified the restoration of the Cain and Abel relationship. 
 
… 
 
Some time ago, when I set out to hold the Korean-Japanese Blessing, Japanese church leaders, including 
Mr. Kuboki, did not believe it was possible; however, after a week of prompting the leaders, it finally 
took place. How many thousands of people were there? Since there were 6,500 couples, it follows that 
well over 10,000 people were participating. Originally, more than 10,000 people had to come from Japan. 
Between 8,000 and 9,000 people flocked into Korea within one week; so do you think they had enough 
airplanes to accommodate them all? Everything was brought to a standstill at one point. I made sure that 
no one knew what was going on. The Korean Embassy in Japan had to mobilize even the families of their 
staff, and for three days and nights did nothing but stamp passports. That is how the condition was 
established for the Japanese and Korean governments to support us. For the 6500 Couples Blessing, the 
Korean government supported us. 
 
… 


