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In accordance with True Mother's instruction to "prepare for the entrance ceremony with the greatest 
devotion of your life," a special 7-day devotion opening ceremony for the Cheon Won Gung Cheon Il 
Sanctum Entrance Ceremony Organizing Committee was held 
 
The special devotion opening ceremony was attended by a total of 58 people from Korea and abroad, 
including Moon Yeon-ah, Co-Chair of the Organizing Committee, Lee Gi-seong, Co-Executive 
Committee Chair, Hwang Bo-guk, Co-Executive Vice Chair, and those involved in planning the entrance 
ceremony and creating praise songs. It was emceed by Kim In-chang, Director of the Cheon Mu Won 
Mission Policy Department, and proceeded in the order of opening declaration, singing of the Cheon Il 
Guk anthem, Family Pledge, report prayer, welcoming remarks, opening address, and closing. 
 
On this day, Co-Executive Vice Chair Hwang Bo-guk offered a report prayer, saying, "Heavenly Parent, 
True Parents of Heaven, Earth and Humankind, we sincerely thank you for the grace of gathering us on 
this precious day to prepare a victorious Cheon Won Gung Cheon Il Sanctum Entrance Ceremony in 
accordance with True Mother's order. As we gather all our wisdom to bring glory to Heavenly Parent and 
True Parents, please work so that all participants can let go of past habits and move forward only for the 
fulfillment of Your will." 
 

 
 
Song Yong-cheon, Co-Executive Committee Chair, shared True Mother's recent words in his opening 
address, saying, "This gathering was arranged according to True Mother's order to prepare for the 
entrance ceremony more thoroughly and meticulously than any other event. I hope that during this special 



 

 

devotion period, as we all deeply reflect on how much devotion and love True Parents have bestowed to 
realize Heavenly Parent's dream throughout this process, we will do our utmost to ensure this becomes the 
foundation for fulfilling Heavenly Parent's will." 
 
Lee Gi-seong, Co-Executive Committee Chair, said in his opening address, "I believe there will surely be 
victorious results for us who come running unconditionally when True Mother calls. The Cheon Won 
Gung Cheon Il Sanctum Entrance Ceremony signifies the fulfillment of Heavenly Parent's dream, the 
completion of the heavenly providence, and the completion of the purpose of creation. It also means the 
historical event of realizing the new heaven and new earth mentioned in Revelation 21 of the Bible. I 
hope we can all become people who can say we served True Parents well before history." 
 

 
 
Moon Yeon-ah, Co-Chair of the Organizing Committee, said in her welcoming remarks, "Above all, 
when I see True Mother agonizing over and over because time is so tight and every moment is so 
precious, I felt that we here must sympathize and empathize with that content. I believe that if we feel 
True Mother's heart and the situations of absolute oneness with Heaven from our own perspective, 
Heaven will work. I hope that starting with this special devotion period, we will sincerely repent and be 
grateful, and that this will be the day of beginning when we can be with Heaven." 
 
Following the opening ceremony, the overall schedule for the special 7-day devotion was composed of 
special lectures (by Lee Ki-sik, Director of the Great Epic Department), praise history, Cheonshim Won 
overnight devotion, sectional meetings, and individual devotion time, according to True Mother's 
guidelines. 
 
On the first day, participants resolved to let go of past thoughts and habits in oneness with Heaven, and to 
open a new chapter fitting for the new era of Cheon Il Guk. 
 
Staff reported the daily progress to True Mother, and on the second day, first-generation providential 
organization leaders and second-generation youth leaders had time to unite through Cheon Il Guk 
communication culture, and time to plan the overall framework by sections. 
 
On the third day, feedback given by True Mother was shared with all participants, and the overall content 
showed signs of being modified, supplemented, and completed. Amidst this, on the fourth day, staff 
members had the honor of visiting Cheon Won Gung with True Mother. Staff members expressed deep 
admiration at the on-site staff's explanation that everything from design to architectural style, symbols, 
patterns, colors, and interior design was carried out under True Mother's direct instructions, and were 
once again moved by True Mother's filial heart in preparing a space for Heavenly Parent. 
 
On this day, True Mother emphasized the meaning of Cheon Won Gung and the importance of the overall 
program while inspecting the site for preparation of next year's Cheon Won Gung Cheon Il Sanctum 
Entrance Ceremony (April 13, 2025 solar calendar). 
 
True Mother emphasized, "For all schedules to proceed without a hitch, it is most important that everyone 
becomes one. We need to open our hearts, share information together, communicate, and make the best 
plans." She also encouraged, "You've worked hard until now. Let's do our best." 
 
In the afternoon of the same day, an 'Integrated Strategy Meeting' led by Lee Cheong-woo, Director of the 



 

 

Cheon Mu Won Mission Policy Department, discussed event operation plans, and on the 5th and 6th 
days, the overall content planned by each section was shared with everyone. Unified plans were 
established centered on True Mother's guidelines. Finally, separate plans were finely coordinated and 
added, and it was felt that the hearts of the staff were also becoming one. 
 
On the last day, staff members were confident that this devotion period had become the starting point for 
opening a new era, the Cheon Il Guk era, and resolved to offer victory to Heavenly Parent and True 
Parents, expressing gratitude and glory to True Mother for allowing this special devotion period. 
 

 
 
Reports 
 
Song Yong-cheon, Director General, World Mission Headquarters 
 
First, I express deep gratitude to True Mother for allowing the closing of the 'Cheon Won Gung Cheon Il 
Sanctum Entrance Ceremony Organizing Committee Special 7-Day Devotion'. Thanks to True Mother's 
interest and love, we were able to fully offer our 7-day course to Heaven with devotion and hard work, 
and welcome a joyful and glorious closing ceremony. Especially, I sincerely thank you for allowing this 
period to mark the full-fledged launch of the entrance ceremony organizing committee, a new departure, 
and a new beginning. We pledge to move forward for the victory of the entrance with one heart and one 
mind. 
 
Hwangbo Guk, President of FFWPU-Korea 
 
Participating in this special devotion, having meetings and offering devotion became an opportunity to 
feel True Mother's heart more deeply. Because True Mother personally offered devotion, built the Cheon 
Il Sanctum, and guided even the interior details one by one, the most beautiful temple in human history 
has been offered to Heaven. For the next 7 months, the Korean Association will do its best and fulfill our 
filial duty so that True Mother can let go of her worries and concerns. Thank you, True Mother. 
 
Yoo Kyung-deuk, Chairman of HJ Magnolia Foundation 
 
The only begotten Daughter, True Mother, opened wide the door of Cheon Il Guk through Foundation 
Day, and finally settled Cheon Il Guk amidst indescribable misunderstandings and tribulations, searching 
for even a single needle with tears of blood. I sincerely thank you for the precious grace of forming an 
organizing committee that can substantially attend Heavenly Parent. I believe that everything we learned 
and shared during this devotion period, receiving direct teachings from True Mother, will become the new 
culture that will proceed in the Cheon Il Guk era. I sincerely thank True Mother for giving us such 
precious grace. 
 
Kim Young-seok, Vice President of FFWPU-Korea 
 
The Cheon Won Gung Cheon Il Sanctum Entrance Organizing Committee special 7-day workshop, which 
began with a heart of repentance and gratitude, is now down to its last day. I will do my best until the end 
to make True Mother more comfortable and reassured. Furthermore, I will practice more in the field for 
the victory of the Cheon Won Gung Cheon Il Sanctum entrance, attending True Mother. 
 



 

 

Hans Campman, Composer 
 
True Mother, I think all the musicians in the spirit world, starting from Europe, they are so eager to 
understand this epic, because they have been wondering endlessly what to write their music for. They 
were never satisfied but now they get the story that they are supposed to write. I can feel this, and I'm so 
grateful that we can contribute this way. 
 
Roh Yong-ju, UPF Organization Education Department Director 
 
The time we spent looking around Cheon Won Gung yesterday, listening to True Mother's words, still 
feels so vivid. As each day of the special 7-day devotion passes, I can feel that Heavenly Parent, True 
Mother, and furthermore the absolute good spirit world are really with us when I see results coming out 
from each department and positive directions being created through discussions. I have made countless 
resolutions to truly create a Cheon Il Guk ruled by Heavenly Parent and True Mother. I will do my best to 
make that day come as soon as possible. 
 
 
 


