
UTS seeks Director of Institutional Research and Assessment 

Kathy Winings 
July 29, 2015 
Vice President for Academic Affairs 

Status of Position: Part-time (25 hours) 

Reports to: Vice President for Academic Affairs 

The Unification Theological Seminary seeks applications for the position of Director of Institutional 
Research and Assessment. Reporting directly to the Vice President for Academic Affairs, the Director of 
Institutional Research and Assessment is responsible for providing leadership in the design, coordination, 
implementation, analysis and reports based on institutional and student learning assessment data and 
analyses. Specific responsibilities include collaboration with the Outcomes Assessment Committee to 
maintain and continually improve the outcomes assessment work of the Seminary, development of 
assessment workshops for faculty, assisting faculty in implementation of assessment instruments as 
needed, collaboration with the Strategic Planning Committee and the Strategic Enrollment Management 
Committee to provide accurate and timely assessment data to support the planning process, keeping up 
with the ongoing development of the field of institutional and student learning assessment and the overall 
coordination of student learning and institutional assessment processes. This position is also responsible 
for maintaining the institution’s Educational Effectiveness portion of its website and for the institution’s 
reporting needs to NYSED and MSCHE (IPEDS). 

The successful candidate should have: 

Masters Degree 

Minimum of 3 years experience in either outcomes assessment or institutional research. 

Evidence of an awareness and understanding of the institutional effectiveness and learning outcomes 
assessment focus in higher education. 

Experience and proficiency with statistics, quantitative data analysis including multivariate techniques, 
and the ability to communicate report results in written reports. 

Proven competency in the technical aspects of general and survey research, including research purpose 
and design, statistical and research methods, data collection and/or extraction, and data analyses and 
evaluation. 

Recent experience using SPSS or SAS. 

Experience with assessment software such as TaskStream, Exam Soft or similar assessment software a 
plus. 

Ability to attend to detail and maintain accuracy in working with statistical information, and to understand 
the policy implications of that information. 

Ability to establish and maintain effective, efficient, personable, and collegial working relationships with 
diverse faculty and staff members. 

Demonstrated effective verbal, written, and graphical communication skills. 

Demonstrated team building and interpersonal skills. 

Evidence of an awareness and understanding of the national trends in educational excellence criteria, and 
inter-institutional benchmarking initiatives. 

Applicants should submit (PDF format) a cover letter describing how relevant experiences address the 
desired qualifications, curriculum vita and contact information for four references (including name, 
address, phone number and email addresses). References will not be contacted without consent from 
applicants. Application materials should be submitted to: Dr. Kathy Winings: academics@uts.edu. 

For more information about UTS, please explore our website at: www.uts.edu. AA/EOE 




