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Visit of Oceania Regional Director Yutaka Yamada and Pastor Greg Stone to Vanuatu 
 
On October 2nd, a successful Sunday service was held in Vanuatu, marking the visit of Oceania Regional 
Director Yutaka Yamada and Pastor Greg Stone. The visit was aimed at ensuring victory for the entrance 
into the Cheon Il Sanctum in Cheon Won Gung in 2025. 
 
The Sunday service was conducted in line with True Mother's words: "As we approach the 2025 entrance 
into the Cheon Il Sanctum in Cheon Won Gung ceremony, let us become blessed families who fulfill our 
duty of filial piety before Heaven, expanding the environmental realm centered on Heavenly Parent, and 
surely create the Kingdom of Heaven on Earth and in Heaven." 
 
Director Yamada emphasized, "In this providential golden age, let us strengthen our sense of community 
to achieve 'victory for the entrance into the Cheon Il Sanctum in Cheon Won Gung,' which is the earnest 
hope of True Mother and the dream of Heavenly Parent and True Parents." Pastor Stone focused on 
educating about True Mother as the substantial Holy Spirit, the only begotten daughter at the Second 
Coming, as part of the ChamBuMoRon. 
 
Through their visit, Director Yamada and Pastor Stone conveyed True Mother's valuable guidelines and 
strategies from Cheon Mu Won and the World Mission Headquarters. Their counsel aimed to help the 
local community strengthen their connection to the global mission, ensuring that they continue to grow in 
their faith and contribute meaningfully to the worldwide movement. 
 
The members attending the Sunday service resolved to strengthen their bonds and commitment to their 
mission, and to maintain continuous communication with the headquarters. They also pledged to increase 



 

 

their efforts for the victory for the entrance into the Cheon Il Sanctum in Cheon Won Gung in 2025, as 
desired by Heavenly Parent and True Mother. 
 

 
 
Regular Tong Il Moo Do Training 
 
In Vanuatu, regular Tong Il Moo Do training sessions were held on Oct. 5 - 12. Tong Il Moo Do is a 
martial art that established a systematic martial philosophy centered on True Parents' ideologies of love 
for Heaven, love for humanity, and love for country. 
 
The core philosophy of Tong Il Moo Do emphasizes love and harmony, aiming to promote individual 
growth and self-development through physical, mental, and emotional development. This regular training 
in Vanuatu was conducted to help the mental and physical health of people of all ages and genders, to 
return to the heart of Heavenly Parent and True Parents, to fulfill filial piety, and to practice a life of 
attendance in the realm of mind-body unity and unity between God and man. 
 
The trainees who participated in this education shared a deep sense of comradeship and common purpose, 
with some experiencing positive outcomes of belonging to the community. An official stated, "As interest 
and participation from various classes and generations in regular Tong Il Moo Do training increases, we 
will continue to conduct training and contribute to community development." 
 
 
 
 


