
Family Celebration Workshop, Blessing and 
Divine Principle Education                                                                                             

 
Lancaster Gate, London, United Kingdom, July 21, 2018  

he Association of British Clergy 
in the UK held our first Family 
Celebration Workshop on 

Saturday the 21st July. Pastor Carlo 
Zaccarelli presented two Divine 
Principle Lectures, and afterwards five 
Pastors were blessed, and there was a 
very uplifting spirit of renewal and 
rededication to God. I am so grateful to 
all the wonderful brothers and sisters 
who contributed their prayers and 
efforts to make the event possible. 

There was great music and singing 
from Pastor Collins, Rev Hanna, 
Joanna Hartl, Barbara Zaccarelli and 
Queen Esther. Pastor Carlo Zaccarelli 
gave 2 spirit filled talks and Dr Hanna 
and Mrs Kyunga Hanna officiated the 
Blessing beautifully, assisted by Joyce 
Suda, Naomi Gyoten and Anne 
Kobayashi, who also provided the 
great refreshments. By June Darby.  
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